
 
 
Assessment Manager: RH2 Page 1 of 3 

Schedule of Accreditation  
issued by 

United Kingdom Accreditation Service 

2 Pine Trees, Chertsey Lane, Staines-upon-Thames, TW18 3HR, UK 
 

 

 

0005 
 

Type A  
Inspection Body 

 

Accredited to  
ISO/IEC 17020:2012 

 

Allianz Engineering  
Inspection Services Limited 

 

Issue No: 031     Issue date: 12 June 2025 
 

57 Ladymead 

Guildford 

Surrey 

GU1 1DB 

 

Contact: Mr Peter Milton  

Tel: +44 (0) 7385 521670 

E-Mail: peter.milton@allianz.co.uk 

Website: www.allianz.co.uk 

Inspection performed at/from the above address only 

DETAIL OF ACCREDITATION 
 

Field of Inspection Type and Range of Inspection Methods and Procedures 

   
Major, Intermediate and Minor 
pressure systems 

Preparation and Certification of 
Written Schemes of Examination  

Pressure Systems Safety 
Regulations SI 2000 No 128 
The Safety, Health and Welfare at 
Work (General 
Applications)(Amendment) 
Regulations 2012 
AE Ref: ES-B 

  

 In-service inspection 

  

 Inspection of Repairs and 
Modifications 

   

   
Lifting Equipment including 
powered lifting appliances, manual 
lifting appliances and lifting gear 
 

In-service inspection Lifting Operations and Lifting 
Equipment Regulations (LOLER) 
1998. 
Provision and Use of Work 
Equipment Regulations (PUWER) 
1998. 
The Provision and Use of Work 
Equipment Regulations (NI) 1999. 
The Lifting Operations and Lifting 
Equipment Reguations (NI) 1999. 
The Safety, Health and Welfare at 
Work (General Applications) 
Regulations 2007 
AE Ref: ES-L and ES-C 
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Field of Inspection Type and Range of Inspection Methods and Procedures 

   
Visual inspection of Personal Fall 
Protection Equipment (PFPE) and 
Personal Fall Protection Systems 
(PFPS) clients’ premises. 

Periodic in-service inspections of 
existing Personal Fall Protection 
Systems (PFPS) installations.  
 
Initital inspections prior to first use 
of PFPS installations.  
 
Periodic in-service inspections of 
Personal Fall Protection Equipment 
(PFPE). 

Allianz procedure ES-L-27 Personal 
Fall protection Equipment.  
BS 7883:2019 – Personal fall 
protection equipment – Anchor 
systems – System design, 
installation and inspection – Code 
of practice. BS 8437:2022 – Code 
of practice for selection, use and 
maintenance of personal fall 
protection systems and equipment 
for use in the workplace.  
PD CEN/TS 16415:2013 – Personal 
fall protection equipment – Anchor 
devices – Recommendations for 
anchor devices for use by more 
than one person simultaneously.  
BS EN 795:2012 Personal fall 
protection equipment – Anchor 
devices.  
INDG401 – HSE – Working at 
Height. The Work at Height 
Regulations 2005. 

   

   
Power Presses and similar 
machines and their safeguarding 
systems 

In-service inspection Provision and Use of Work 
Equipment Regulations (PUWER) 
1998 - Part IV 
AE Ref: ES-PP 

   

   
Local Exhaust Ventilation Plant 
(LEV) 

Thorough examination & test of 
engineering control measures, 
commissioning 

Control of Substances Hazardous 
to Health Regulations 2002  
(as amended) 
AE Ref: ES-LEV 

   

   
Low Voltage Electrical Installations 
 
 

Periodic inspection of existing 
installations 
 

Internal Procedures  
BS 7671 :2018 (as amended)- 
Requirements for electrical 
installations 
(IET Wiring Regulations)   
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Field of Inspection Type and Range of Inspection Methods and Procedures 

   
Electrical Equipment and 
Installations for Electric Vehicle 
Charging Points.   
 
 

Periodic inspection of existing 
installations 
 
 
 

Internal Procedures  
ES-E-03-01-TG-09 EVCE 
Inspection service 
BS 7671:2018 (IET Wiring 
Regulations)  

   

   
Low Voltage Electrical equipment in 
quarries 

Periodic inspection AE internal procedures referencing 
BS 7671 and quarry regulations 

   

   
Electrical Equipment and 
installations in potentially explosive 
atmospheres 

Periodic inspection of existing 
equipment and installations. Grades 
of inspection: visual and close  

Internal procedures  
BS EN 60079 - 17:2014 
BS EN 61241 - 17:2005 (withdrawn) 

   

   
Electrical equipment and 
installations in petroleum filling 
stations 

Periodic inspection of existing 
equipment and installations 

Internal procedures ‘Design, 
Constructions, Modification, 
Maintenance and Decommisioning 
of Filling Stations’ - APEA and 
Energy Institute 

   

Inspections completed within the United Kingdom and the Republic of Ireland Only, to the applicable regulations 
stipulated above. 

END 

 
 
 
 
 
 


